War Pensions Amendment
Act (No 2) 2010

Public Act 2010 No 106
Date of assent 23 August 2010
Commencement see section 2

Contents
Page
1 Title 1
2 Commencement 1
3 Principal Act amended 1
4 Interpretation 1
5 Abatement 2

The Parliament of New Zealand enacts as follows:

1 Title
This Act is the War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2) 2010.

2 Commencement
This Act comes into force on 27 September 2010.

3 Principal Act amended
This Act amends the War Pensions Act 1954.

4 Interpretation
The definition of Income Test 3 in section 67(1) is amended
by omitting “$80” and substituting “$100”.


http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM284374
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM285276

s5 War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2) 2010 2010 No 106

5 Abatement

(1)  Section 74D(3)(a) and (4)(a) are amended by omitting “$80”
and substituting in each case “$100”.

(2)  Section 74D is amended by omitting “$180” in each place
where it appears and substituting in each case “$200”.

Legislative history

17 August 2010 Divided from Social Assistance (New Work Tests,
Incentives, and Obligations) Amendment Bill
(Bill 125-2) by committee of the whole House as

Bill 125-3E
18 August 2010 Third reading
23 August 2010 Royal assent

This Act is administered by the New Zealand Defence Force and Veterans’ Affairs New
Zealand.

Wellington, New Zealand:
Published under the authority of the New Zealand Government—2010


http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM285563
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM285563

